
Item
Bid Price & 

Unit

M&M 

Pavement 

Marking

Michigan 

Pavement 

Markings

PK 

Contracting

1.  Mobilization Ea 300 0 250

Due to a chip seal program, the pavement 

marking may be divided into two time 

periods.  If work is authorized in a manner 

that requires an additional mobilization, the 

unit prices will prevail for each mobilization. 

2. Application of Waterborne Paint.  

Application Rate Per Industry Standard

a.  Waterborne 4” White LFT 0.0398 0.04 0.0405

b.  Waterborne 4” Yellow LFT 0.04 0.04 0.0405

c.  Waterborne 6" White LFT 0.055 0.052 0.06

3. Application of Plural Component 

Modified Urethane.  Application Rate Per 

Industry Standard

1650

a.  Plural Component Modified Urethane 4” 

White
LFT No Bid No Bid 0.45

b.  Plural Component Modified Urethane 4” 

Yellow
LFT No Bid No Bid 0.45

4. Removal of Existing 4” Line

a.  Mobilization Ea 300 0 500

b.  Removal LFT 0.5 0.25 0.25

c.  Removal Special SFT 1.5 0.5 1.25

5.  Recessing Pavement 1200

a.  Recess 20 mil for waterborne paint LFT No Bid No Bid 0.4

b.  Recess 30 mil for all other paints LFT No Bid No Bid 0.45

State availability of equipment and notice of 

requirements for each equipment furnished by 

the Supplier:

Terms:

LONG LINE PAINTING

BID TAB 2018


