
Manufacturer:

FACE MATERIAL - HI INTENSITY PRISMATIC

Dornbos Lightle MDSolutions Osburn Rocal

Item 1 – Signs Size (W&H)

Reflectors – per 100 (1 1/4" 

Round)

1.35 Alum      .91 

Plastic
0.80 1.50 No Bid No Bid

30” x 30” Oct. (Stop) 8.50 11.75 11.94 8.94 11.43

30” x 30” Stop Ahead Symbol 10.90 12.90 12.40 8.94 16.43

36” x 36” Oct. (Stop) 12.24 16.92 17.20 12.87 16.47

36” x 36” Stop Ahead Symbol 15.64 18.80 18.00 12.87 22.47

36”  Triangle (Yield) 6.12 8.60 15.00 6.44 6.96

36” x 36” Yield Ahead Symbol 15.64 18.80 18.00 12.87 22.47

18” x 18” Diamond 3.06 4.23 4.30 3.22 4.12

30” x 30” Diamond 8.50 11.75 13.00 8.94 11.44

36” x 36” Diamond 12.24 16.92 18.00 12.87 16.47

36” x 36” Signal Ahead Symbol 15.64 17.98 18.00 12.87 21.47

48” x 48” Diamond 21.76 30.08 32.00 22.88 34.28

4” x 8”  Rectangle 0.79 0.50 1.00 0.48 5.40

12” x 12” Rectangle 1.36 1.90 2.50 1.43 6.83

12” x 18” Rectangle 2.04 2.82 3.50 2.15 7.75

12” x 36” Rectangle 4.08 5.64 6.00 4.29 10.49

18” x 18” Rectangle 3.06 4.23 4.50 3.22 9.12

24” x 8” Rectangle 1.80 2.52 3.50 1.91 7.43

24” x 12” Rectangle 2.72 3.76 4.50 2.86 8.66

24” x 18” Rectangle 4.08 5.64 7.00 4.29 10.49

24” x 24” Rectangle 5.44 7.52 9.00 5.72 12.32

24” x 30” Rectangle 6.80 9.40 11.00 7.15 14.15

24” x 42” Rectangle 9.52 13.16 14.00 10.01 17.81

30” x 30” Rectangle 8.50 11.75 13.00 8.94 16.44

48” x 12” Rectangle (Advance 

Road Name)
5.44 9.20 12.00 5.72 12.32

48” x 24” Rectangle 10.88 15.04 17.00 11.44 19.64

48” x 30” Rectangle 13.60 18.80 21.00 14.30 23.30

36” Diameter Round (Railroad 

Advance)
12.24 16.92 18.00 12.87 21.47

48” x 9” (2) Railroad Crossbuck 8.16 11.28 18.00 12.84 15.98

Item 2 –Extruded Aluminum 

Street Name Sign

24” x 6 2.55 3.99 4.50 2.96 16.28

30” x 6” 3.18 4.99 5.63 3.70 20.34

36” x 6 3.82 5.99 7.00 4.44 24.42

24” x 9” 3.82 5.99 6.50 4.44 17.42

30” x 9” 4.76 7.48 8.50 5.56 21.78

36” x 9” 5.73 8.98 10.13 6.66 26.13

Sign Material

Bid Tab 2018



FINISHED SIGN HI INTENSITY PRISMATIC

Item 1 – Signs Size (W & H)

Reflectors – per 100 (1 1/4' round)
1.35 Alum     .91 

Plastic
0.80 1.50 No Bid No Bid

30” x 30” Oct. (Stop) 22.67 29.30 28.89 23.50 25.38

30” x 30” Stop Ahead Symbol 27.02 32.60 30.00 24.63 30.38

36” x 36” Oct. (Stop) 32.68 43.90 41.58 3.5.46 36.54

36” x 36” Stop Ahead Symbol 38.86 47.20 43.00 35.46 41.54

36”  Triangle (Yield) 17.73 22.40 22.00 17.73 16.24

36” x 36” Yield Ahead Symbol 38.86 47.20 43.00 35.46 41.54

18” x 18” Diamond 8.86 11.14 10.40 8.87 9.14

30” x 30” Diamond 24.62 30.94 30.00 24.63 25.38

36” x 36” Diamond 35.46 44.55 43.00 35.46 36.54

36” x 36” Signal Ahead Symbol 38.86 46.80 43.00 35.46 41.54

48” x 48” Diamond 63.04 79.20 80.00 63.04 69.96

4” x 8”  Rectangle 1.36 1.40 2.00 1.18 5.89

12” x 12” Rectangle 3.94 5.10 5.00 3.94 9.06

12” x 18” Rectangle 2.91 7.43 8.00 5.91 11.09

12” x 36” Rectangle 11.82 14.85 14.50 11.82 17.18

18” x 18” Rectangle 8.86 11.14 11.00 8.87 14.14

24” x 8” Rectangle 5.24 6.64 6.50 5.26 10.40

24” x 12” Rectangle 7.88 9.90 10.00 7.88 13.12

24” x 18” Rectangle 11.82 14.85 15.00 11.82 17.18

24” x 24” Rectangle 15.76 19.80 20.00 15.76 21.24

24” x 30” Rectangle 19.70 24.75 25.00 19.70 25.30

24” x 42” Rectangle 27.58 34.65 35.00 27.58 33.42

30” x 30” Rectangle 24.62 30.94 30.00 24.63 30.38

48” x 12” Rectangle (Advance 

Road Name)
15.76 22.40 20.00 15.76 21.24

48” x 24” Rectangle 31.52 39.60 40.00 31.52 37.48

48” x 30” Rectangle 39.40 49.50 50.00 39.40 45.60

36” Diameter Round (Railroad 

Advance)
31.55 44.50 43.00 35.46 41.54

48” x 9” (2) Railroad Crossbuck 42.78 29.70 60.00 198.78 17.18

Item 2 –Extruded Aluminum 

Street Name Sign

24” x 6 16.75 13.10 14.00 13.24 20.28

30” x 6” 20.93 16.38 17.50 16.55 25.35

36” x 6 22.16 19.65 21.00 19.86 30.42

24” x 9” 21.98 19.13 21.00 19.86 23.27

30” x 9” 25.33 23.91 26.25 24.83 29.08

36” x 9” 31.02 28.69 31.50 29.79 34.91

Item 3 – Spacers

Rectangular Metal /300 ea 0.47 0.48 1.50 No Bid 2.48

Item 4 – Brackets

91UX Road Name Sign 

Brackets/ea 3.15 3.20 3.50 3.48 6.75

Item 5 –Sheeting

High Intensity Retroreflective 

Sheeting.  Color: White
1.29 1.45 1.43 1.17 1.83



Manufacturer:

High Intensity Retroreflective 

Sheeting.  Color: Red
1.29 1.45 1.43 1.17 1.83

Manufacturer:

High Intensity Retroreflective 

Sheeting.  Color: Yellow
1.29 1.45 1.43 1.17 1.83

Manufacturer:  

30” Rolled Vinyl Sheeting – High 

Intensity/Sft WHITE
1.20 1.10 2.16 0.96 1.28

Manufacturer:

30” Rolled Vinyl Sheeting – High 

Intensity/Sft Black
1.20 1.10 2.16 0.96 1.28

Manufacturer: 3M 3M 3M 3M/Avery Avery

Warranties: 3M Warranty
Per 3M 

standard Standard 3M/Avery 1 Year

Terms of Sale and Discounts N30 N30 None Net 30 Net 30


